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1 4 50
Sheep brains: w/ durameter; formaldehyde free- 
full extracted- 50 vac pac $1,912.00  NO BID $0.00  $                         510.10 $2,040.40  NO BID $0.00  $                           82.48 $1,649.60  NO BID $0.00  $                             9.63 $1,926.00  $                         444.77 $1,779.08 

2 4 50
Preserved cow eyes: formaldehyde free- 50 vac 
pac $450.80  NO BID $0.00  $                           72.35 $289.40  NO BID $0.00  $                           54.69 $218.76  NO BID $0.00  $                             2.31 $462.00  $                         109.53 $438.12 

3 72 500 ml Phenol 88% 500 ml bottles $2,898.72 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 36.63$                           $2,637.36 35.23$                           $2,536.56 65.82$                           $4,739.04 26.99$                           $1,943.28 -$                               $0.00 

4 6 4L Propylene Glycol - 4 liter plastic bottle $493.92 22.50$                           $135.00 NO BID $0.00 87.14$                           $522.84 55.25$                           $331.50 NO BID $0.00 10.43$                           $500.64 -$                               $0.00 

5 2 4x1gallon
95% Ethyl alcohol -  case of 4 x 1 gallon bottles (4 
gallons total) $37.96 113.96$                         $911.68 NO BID $0.00 443.54$                         $887.08 67.33$                           $134.66 41.45$                           $82.90 8.58$                             $68.64 -$                               $0.00 

6 2
20 L 
cubitainer Isopropyl alcohol 70% 20 liter cubitatiner $249.30 139.26$                         $278.52 NO BID $0.00 126.50$                         $253.00 120.11$                         $240.22 174.82$                         $349.64 97.27$                           $194.54 -$                               $0.00 

7 6 Pkg. of 10 Blades for No. 4 scalpel- size No. 22 pkg of 10 $12.48 47.76$                           $47.76 1.73$                             $10.38 NO BID $0.00 0.70$                             $4.20 1.52$                             $9.12 24.29$                           $24.29 2.23$                             $13.38 

8 6 set
Lung Function Bell Jar Model: diaphragm and 
balloon refill $158.76 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 51.45$                           $308.70 -$                               $0.00 

9 24 1ml Carolina 10 X loading dye- 1 ml $0.00  NO BID $0.00  NO BID $0.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             1.67 $8.35  NO BID $0.00  $                             4.55 $109.20  $                                 -   $0.00 

10 1 pk of 6
Broken glass boxes, pk of 6 - floor model 
12x12x27h $44.42 54.52$                           $54.52 54.11$                           $54.11 43.77$                           $43.77 70.79$                           $70.79 30.06$                           $30.06 49.35$                           $49.35 -$                               $0.00 

11 1 pk 6 Benchtop broken glass boxes $29.54 40.67$                           $40.67 NO BID $0.00 32.25$                           $32.25 67.53$                           $67.53 24.58$                           $24.58 36.48$                           $36.48 -$                               $0.00 

12 1
Case of 10 
pk of 100

Pre-moistened lens cleaning tissues, 100 
individual wipes. Case of 10. $92.40  $                           10.23 $102.30  $                           15.80 $15.80  $                           51.87 $51.87  $                           98.30 $98.30  $                           55.70 $55.70  $                           17.15 $686.00  $                                 -   $0.00 

13 50 each
Inoculating loop- twisted nichrome wire, 25 
gauge, 5mm loop, 8" handle $0.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             1.68 $84.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             1.14 $57.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             2.00 $100.00  $                                 -   $0.00 

14 50 each 
Inoculating nicrhome wire needle with 8" 
alminum handle- nichrome wire 25 guage $101.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             2.21 $110.50  NO BID $0.00  $                             1.16 $58.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             2.00 $100.00  $                                 -   $0.00 

15 100 Pack of 72 
Carolina Standard microscope slides- 25x75mm, 
72 per box $725.00  $                           10.73 $1,073.00  NO BID $0.00  $                           66.93 $334.65  $                             2.31 $231.00  $                           14.18 $709.00  $                             7.39 $739.00  $                                 -   $0.00 

16 300 Box of 18
Carolina Glass Cover Slips- 22x22mm, No. 2 glass, 
18 per box $351.54  $                             5.44 $163.20  $                             1.29 $69.66  $                           22.50 $90.00  $                             4.31 $1,293.00  $                           11.96 $538.20  $                             3.36 $10.08  $                                 -   $0.00 

17 1
1 case of 
1000 Genskin, powder free, nitrile gloves- size large $204.80 8.11$                             $162.20 53.00$                           $53.00 49.19$                           $49.19 49.16$                           $49.16 75.82$                           $75.82 114.10$                         $114.10 -$                               $0.00 

18 1
1 case of 
1000 Genskin, powder free, nitrile gloves- size Xlarge $204.80 8.13$                             $162.60 53.00$                           $53.00 49.19$                           $49.19 49.16$                           $49.16 75.82$                           $75.82 114.10$                         $114.10 -$                               $0.00 

19 4
1 case of 
1000 Genskin, powder free, nitrile gloves- size medium $819.20 8.10$                             $648.00 53.00$                           $212.00 49.19$                           $196.76 49.16$                           $196.64 75.82$                           $303.28 114.10$                         $456.40 -$                               $0.00 

20 2
1 case of 
1000 Genskin, powder free, nitrile gloves- size small $409.60 8.08$                             $323.20 53.00$                           $106.00 49.19$                           $98.38 49.16$                           $98.32 75.82$                           $151.64 114.10$                         $228.20 -$                               $0.00 

21 40
280 per 
box Kimwipes Cleaning tissue- 4.5"x8.5"; 280 per box $156.80  $                           88.71 $16,588.77  $                             2.51 $100.40  $                             2.93 $117.20  $                             1.56 $62.40  $                             2.71 $108.40  $                             3.22 $128.80  $                                 -   $0.00 

22 1
case of 
4000 Alcohol Pads- individually wrapped, pk 4000 $182.40  $                           20.98 $839.20  $                           45.80 $45.80  $                           30.20 $30.20  $                           40.47 $40.47  $                           40.51 $40.51  $                           39.55 $158.20  $                                 -   $0.00 

23 6 Pkg 12
Glass Depression Slides, 1.5mm thick, with single 
cavity $47.46  NO BID $0.00  NO BID $0.00  NO BID $0.00  $                             2.63 $15.78  $                           43.23 $259.38  $                             1.47 $105.84  $                                 -   $0.00 

24 6
4" x 125 
ft. roll Parafilm $106.50 21.25$                           $63.75 18.85$                           $113.10 19.92$                           $119.52 20.49$                           $122.94 26.99$                           $161.94 18.17$                           $109.02 -$                               $0.00 

25 6 50 Glucose Paper Test Strips $41.79 32.00$                           $192.00 10.71$                           $32.13 NO BID $0.00 6.85$                             $41.10 14.42$                           $43.26 13.97$                           $41.91 -$                               $0.00 

26 6 100g Maltose, reagent grade 100 grams $42.42 23.24$                           $139.44 NO BID $0.00 27.88$                           $167.28 84.63$                           $507.78 38.36$                           $230.16 6.58$                             $39.48 -$                               $0.00 

27 4 4 liters 3% Hydrogen Peroxide- 4liters $50.00 1.88$                             $63.92 6.68$                             $26.72 29.37$                           $117.48 10.09$                           $40.36 14.75$                           $59.00 11.97$                           $47.88 -$                               $0.00 

28 6 unit
Eppendorf Research Plue Single Channel Pipette. 
Volume 0.5ul-10ul.  Grey color. $2,154.00 421.31$                         $2,527.86 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 311.74$                         $1,870.44 308.87$                         $1,853.22 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

29 4
pack of 
500

1.5ml Microcentrifuge tubes with tether screw 
cap. Sterile. Pack of 500. $54.88 NO BID $0.00 16.05$                           $64.20 160.95$                         $643.80 79.36$                           $317.44 94.46$                           $377.84 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

30 2 pk. Of 25 Serological Pipets Polystyrene Sterile 25 x 0.2ml $0.00 77.91$                           $77.91 9.00$                             $18.00 24.08$                           $48.16 174.48$                         $174.48 10.49$                           $20.98 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

31 50 pk of 50
Disposable Sterile Plastic Pipettes, individually 
wrapped- 1mL capacity $0.00 170.77$                         $1,195.39 4.60$                             $230.00 27.98$                           $699.50 106.16$                         $318.48 NO BID $0.00 27.00$                           $54.00 -$                               $0.00 

32 20 pk of 50  
Disposable Sterile Plastic Pipettes, individually 
wrapped- 5 x 0.1mL mL capacity $0.00 41.43$                           $207.15 7.05$                             $141.00 23.55$                           $471.00 30.33$                           $151.65 NO BID $0.00 12.95$                           $647.50 -$                               $0.00 

Fisher Scientific Carolina Biological Delta BiologicalFLINN SCIENTIFIC GRAINGER FREY SCIENTIFIC SPECTRUM CHEMICAL MFG. CORP. VWR
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33 6 pk 200
Disposable Sterile Plastic Pipettes, individually 
wrapped- 10 x 0.1mL mL capacity $0.00 49.33$                           $295.98 NO BID $0.00 83.46$                           $500.76 31.87$                           $191.22 NO BID $0.00 13.13$                           $433.29 -$                               $0.00 

34 2
10 pkgs of 
100

Polyester tip/ plastic shaft applicators- 6" sterile, 
2 per envelope, sterile Case of 10 pkgs of 100 $174.70 4.55$                             $91.00 NO BID $0.00 26.73$                           $53.46 72.50$                           $72.50 64.10$                           $128.20 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

35 36 5 yards Cheesecloth 5 yards, pack of 5 $179.55 221.81$                         $221.81 14.64$                           $527.04 NO BID $0.00 3.39$                             $122.04 4.95$                             $891.00 9.70$                             $582.00 -$                               $0.00 

36 12 pkg 4 Sharpies, fine point, pkg 4 $100.80 4.63$                             $55.56 4.10$                             $49.20 15.65$                           $187.80 2.00$                             $48.00 15.92$                           $63.68 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

37 1 10 rolls
Labeling tape (package of 10 assorted colors; 
autoclavable) $74.41  $                           63.00 $126.00  NO BID $0.00  $                           67.56 $67.56  $                           11.38 $11.38  $                           33.27 $33.27  $                           43.47 $43.47  $                                 -   $0.00 

38 1
case of 
100 

Polypropylene printed red Biohazard bags- 
37x48"- red-2ml thick-pkg 100 $0.00 179.97$                         $179.97 NO BID $0.00 355.52$                         $355.52 194.81$                         $194.81 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

39 1
case of 
200 

Polypropylene printed red Biohazard bags- 
25X35"- red-2ml thick-pkg 200 $0.00 230.52$                         $230.52 NO BID $0.00 365.82$                         $365.82 209.13$                         $209.13 433.31$                         $433.31 112.92$                         $112.92 -$                               $0.00 

40 1
case of 
200 

Polypropylene printed red Biohazard bags- 
19x23"- red-2ml thick-pkg 200 $0.00 125.59$                         $125.59 NO BID $0.00 195.46$                         $194.46 198.89$                         $198.89 227.16$                         $227.16 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

41 6
10 racks of 
96

Eppendorf epT.I.P.S. micropipet tips 2-200ul 10 
racks of 96 $1,713.00 186.92$                         $1,121.52 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 69.27$                           $415.62 73.63$                           $441.78 9.07$                             $54.42 -$                               $0.00 

42 6
10 racks of 
96

Eppendorf epT.I.P.S. micropipet tips 0.1-10ul 10 
racks of 96 $0.00 193.35$                         $1,160.10 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 87.02$                           $522.12 94.38$                           $566.28 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

43 6
10 racks of 
96

Eppendorf epT.I.P.S. micropipet tips 50-1000 ul 
10 racks of 96 $497.94 185.72$                         $1,114.32 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 75.52$                           $453.12 79.56$                           $477.36 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

44 2 500 pk Thin Stem pipettes- 6", pack 500 $35.84 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 17.43$                           $34.86 50.65$                           $101.30 12.49$                           $24.98 5.50$                             $54.95 -$                               $0.00 

45 1 case of 48 Masking Tape 3/4"  case of 48 $126.24  $                           67.44 $67.44  $                           48.00 $48.00  NO BID $0.00  $                           60.23 $60.23  $                         258.32 $258.32  NO BID $0.00  $                                 -   $0.00 

46 20 Vial of 100 Blank Sterile Discs- vial of 100 $320.80  NO BID $0.00  $                           14.02 $280.40  NO BID $0.00  $                           14.79 $295.80  $                             7.23 $144.60  $                             8.23 $329.20  $                                 -   $0.00 

47 8
Case of 
500 Petri dishes - sterile, polystyrene 60 x 15 mm $838.00 NO BID $0.00 51.62$                           $412.96 60.34$                           $482.72 56.24$                           $449.92 57.67$                           $461.36 87.40$                           $699.20 -$                               $0.00 

48 2
Case of 
500

Petri dishes - sterile, polystyrene 100mm x 15 
mm $183.50 60.77$                           $121.54 NO BID $0.00 55.63$                           $111.26 69.69$                           $139.38 65.96$                           $131.92 83.76$                           $167.52 -$                               $0.00 

49 2
Case of 
1000 Flint glass test tubes w/ plain end 6 x 50 mm $560.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 44.52$                           $89.04 213.93$                         $641.79 29.41$                           $58.82 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

50 6
Case of 
1000 Culture tubes w/ plain end 13 X 100 mm $340.32 73.39$                           $880.68 NO BID $0.00 38.10$                           $228.60 199.96$                         $1,799.64 37.31$                           $223.86 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

51 12
12 books 
of 50

Paper Bibulous books- 50 sheets per book, size 
4x6", 12 books per pack $156.96 NO BID $0.00 18.60$                           $223.20 NO BID $0.00 21.13$                           $253.56 19.06$                           $228.72 2.73$                             $32.76 -$                               $0.00 

52 3
10 pk of 
50 disks

Streptomycin- sensi disc susceptibility test discs- 
10 cartridges of 50 $308.70 NO BID $0.00 79.90$                           $239.70 NO BID $0.00 87.64$                           $262.92 87.31$                           $261.93 7.67$                             $23.01 -$                               $0.00 

53 3
10 pk of 
50 disks

Penicillin- sensi disc susceptibility test discs- 10 
cartridges of 50 $308.70 NO BID $0.00 79.90$                           $239.70 NO BID $0.00 87.64$                           $262.92 87.31$                           $261.93 7.67$                             $23.01 -$                               $0.00 

54 3
10 pk of 
50 disks

Tetracycline- sensi disc susceptibility test discs- 10 
cartridges of 50 $308.70 NO BID $0.00 79.90$                           $239.70 NO BID $0.00 87.64$                           $262.92 87.31$                           $261.93 7.67$                             $23.01 -$                               $0.00 

55 3
pk of 50 
discs

Erythromycin- sensi disc susceptibility test discs- 
10 cartridges of 50 $30.87 NO BID $0.00 79.90$                           $239.70 NO BID $0.00 87.64$                           $262.92 87.31$                           $261.93 7.67$                             $23.01 -$                               $0.00 

56 3 pkg 75
BD Dryslide- Oxidase Reagent testing- each slide 
contains 4 reaction areas $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 139.40$                         $418.20 140.24$                         $420.72 157.47$                         $472.41 -$                               $0.00 

57 15 kit

Carolina PTC Extraction, Amplification, and 
Electrophoresis Marker 0.2ml tubes with 
perishables $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 151.20$                         $2,268.00 -$                               $0.00 

58 15 150ul tube
GelGreenTM Nucleic acid gel stain 10,000X in 
water. 150ul $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

59 2 250
Dispoable inoculating loop and needle, 1ul, 
individually wrapped. 250 pk $81.50 73.41$                           $73.41 NO BID $0.00 66.33$                           $66.33 18.14$                           $36.28 27.15$                           $54.30 53.90$                           $107.80 -$                               $0.00 

60 12
Culture 
set Basic Bacteriophage Culture Set A $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 33.67$                           $404.04 45.55$                           $546.60 30.45$                           $365.40 -$                               $0.00 

61 2 1 liter Safranin- 1 liter $38.52 NO BID $0.00 38.20$                           $76.40 NO BID $0.00 30.15$                           $30.15 NO BID $0.00 17.89$                           $35.78 -$                               $0.00 

62 2 1 liter
Hucker Ammonium Oxalate Crystal Violet, 500ml. 
For gram stain. $65.40 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 99.09$                           $198.18 3.28$                             $6.56 46.25$                           $92.50 16.45$                           $32.90 -$                               $0.00 

63 2 1 liter Methylene Blue Loeffler Solution- 500ml $41.60 17.17$                           $68.68 5.65$                             $11.30 19.05$                           $76.20 4.50$                             $9.00 60.33$                           $120.66 10.40$                           $20.80 -$                               $0.00 

64 3 culture Serratia marcescens  living culture tube $34.05 NO BID $0.00 14.05$                           $42.15 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 12.01$                           $36.03 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 
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65 3 culture P. aeruginosa  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 18.33$                           $54.99 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

66 3 culture S. epidermidis living culture tube $32.85 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 18.79$                           $56.37 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

67 3 culture S. aureus  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 18.33$                           $54.99 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

68 3 culture E. faecalis  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

69 3 culture M. phlei living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

70 3 culture Bacillus subtillis  living culture tube $34.05 NO BID $0.00 16.05$                           $48.15 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

71 3 culture E. aerogenes  living culture tube $34.05 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

72 3 culture P. fluorescens living culture tube $33.90 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

73 3 culture C. freundii  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

74 3 culture Proteus vulgaris  micro kwik culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 16.31$                           $48.93 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

75 3 culture Bacillus catarrhalis  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

76 3 culture Chromobacterium violaceum  living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

77 3 culture Micrococcus luteus  lving culture tube $33.90 NO BID $0.00 16.05$                           $48.15 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 12.57$                           $37.71 -$                               $0.00 

78 3 culture Micrococcus roseus  living culture tube $33.90 NO BID $0.00 16.05$                           $48.15 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

79 3 culture Bacillus megaterium  living culture tube $40.65 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

80 6 culture E. coli living culture tube $68.10 NO BID $0.00 14.05$                           $84.30 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $55.14 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $47.28 -$                               $0.00 

81 3 culture B. cereus living culture tube $33.90 NO BID $0.00 14.05$                           $42.15 NO BID $0.00 9.19$                             $27.57 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

82 3 culture S. lutea, living culture tube $0.00 NO BID $0.00 16.05$                           $48.15 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 7.88$                             $23.64 -$                               $0.00 

83 1
pack of 
200

Instant sealing sterilization pouch, 200 pk. 10" x 
5.25" $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 13.10$                           $13.10 20.56$                           $20.56 26.59$                           $26.59 28.68$                           $28.68 -$                               $0.00 

84 1 pk 250 Chemitest Indicator Strips- pk 250 $0.00 211.88$                         $635.64 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 49.91$                           $49.91 55.63$                           $55.63 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

85 1 pk 200
Instant sealing sterilization pouch, 200 pk. 13" x 
7". $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 16.68$                           $16.68 28.95$                           $28.95 34.29$                           $34.29 45.68$                           $45.68 -$                               $0.00 

86 2 each Instant Ocean- makes 50 gallons $84.40 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 10.16$                           $20.32 41.17$                           $41.17 22.23$                           $44.46 -$                               $0.00 

87 24 each
27"+ dogfish shark, preserved formaldehyde free, 
plain, individual vac pack $0.00 NO BID $0.00 11.44$                           $274.56 NO BID $0.00 17.12$                           $410.88 NO BID $0.00 8.75$                             $210.00 10.99$                           $263.76 

88 24 each
27"+ pregnant dogfish shark, preserved 
formaldehyde free, plain, individual vac pack $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 24.08$                           $577.92 NO BID $0.00 12.25$                           $294.00 13.99$                           $335.76 

89 6 pail of 10
Preserved 4"+, crayfish, formaldehyde free, plain, 
pail of 10 $576.00 NO BID $0.00 8.64$                             $51.84 NO BID $0.00 10.41$                           $62.46 NO BID $0.00 8.19$                             $49.14 9.42$                             $56.52 

90 3 box 12

Test tube cuvettes, 1/2" diameter, box of 12. For 
use with the Spectrosonic 200 
Spectrophotometer $0.00 NO BID $0.00 35.74$                           $107.22 79.70$                           $239.10 81.22$                           $243.66 88.10$                           $264.30 71.75$                           $215.25 -$                               $0.00 

91 2 each

Ovation Electronic Pipette- 1 channel, 0.2-10ml, 
custom programmable volume pre-sets, one 
button draw and release, with power supply. $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 521.89$                         $1,043.78 569.34$                         $1,138.68 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

92 2 each

Fotodyne FOTO/ Phoresis UV Transilluminator for 
DNA gels. UV blocking safety interlocked cover 
that supports FOTO/Phoresis camera hood, $810.00 NO BID $0.00 441.72$                         $883.44 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 848.33$                         $1,696.66 NO BID $0.00 -$                               $0.00 

93 6 each

Spectrosonic 200 Spectrophotometer- 340-
1000nm wave lengths, room light immunity 
chamber, chamber accepts 1/2" diameter test 
tube cuvettes $6,594.00 3,414.52$                      $20,487.12 1,190.80$                      $7,144.80 1,837.00$                      $11,022.00 1,642.57$                      $9,855.42 1,264.16$                      $7,584.96 1,046.50$                      $6,279.00 -$                               $0.00 

$26,962.29 $53,054.92 $15,279.96 $21,963.93 $32,051.48 $28,421.27 $23,136.42 $2,886.62 
Total for All
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