
Name: Fall 2018 Noncredit Schedules Date: May 23, 2018

Description

Woodward Printing 
Services
Platteville, WI

FCL Graphics, Inc.
Harwood Heights, IL

Castle Printech, Inc.
DeKalb, IL

John Swift Company, Inc.
Buffalo Grove, IL

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 1 - 40 Pages  NO BID  NO BID  $                            35,905.00  $                            30,981.00 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 1 - 32 Pages  NO BID  NO BID  $                            32,960.00  $                            27,977.00 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 2 - 40 Pages  NO BID  $                            38,411.00  $                            36,250.00  $                            34,771.00 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 2 - 32 Pages  NO BID  $                            32,110.00  $                            33,235.00  $                            31,011.00 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 3 - 40 Pages  NO BID  $                            38,109.00  NO BID  NO BID 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Option 3 - 32 Pages  NO BID  $                            31,872.00  NO BID  NO BID 

Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 1 - 40 
pages  $                            22,414.00  NO BID  $                            29,865.00  N/A 
Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 1 - 32 
pages  $                            20,017.00  NO BID  $                            26,920.00  N/A 
Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 2 - 40 
pages  $                            23,864.00  $                            33,360.00  $                            30,210.00  N/A 
Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 2 - 32 
pages  $                            21,172.00  $                            27,163.00  $                            27,195.00  N/A 
Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 3 - 40 
pages  NO BID  $                            33,065.00  NO BID  N/A 
Printing of 165,500 Fall 2018 Noncredit 
Schedules - Alternate Bid - Option 3 - 32 
pages  NO BID  $                            26,935.00  NO BID  N/A 
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